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Shaping the future together: The
Nemetschek Group presents its solutions
at ReBuild Ukraine

Munich, November 8, 2023 – From November 14 to 15, the Nemetschek
Group will participate in ReBuild Ukraine in Warsaw. The international event
is specifically dedicated to the reconstruction of war-torn Ukraine. The
Nemetschek Group will be represented in Poland with five brands. It will
present software solutions that can contribute to the efficient reconstruction
of buildings and infrastructure, such as tunnels and bridges.

The focus of the trade fair and conference, which will take place for the
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second time in 2023, is on infrastructure, industry, energy, and residential
construction. Everything revolves around the necessary materials,
technologies, equipment, and investments. The main objective of ReBuild
Ukraine is to create a platform for international institutions to aid in the
reconstruction of Ukrainian cities and communities and to support Ukrainian
energy companies in restoring critical infrastructure facilities.

As an international software provider, the Nemetschek Group and its brands
Allplan, Bluebeam, Graphisoft, and Solibri and the horizontal, data-driven
digital twin platform dTwin will showcase how digital solutions can support a
rapid reconstruction. The solutions are used in infrastructure projects such as
tunnels and bridges, building construction and civil engineering, and
construction with precast concrete elements. In addition, there are solutions
for quality management and control, collaboration, as-built digitalization, and
data management, which provide the basis for efficient, resource-saving
operation of new buildings and infrastructure. Fast, smooth processes and
barrier-free collaboration between all project participants have characterized
Nemetschek solutions along the entire building value chain for over half a
century.

Yves Padrines, CEO of the Nemetschek Group, said, "We are all moved by the
difficult situation of the people in Ukraine. As an international company with
European roots, we are aware of the responsibility we have now and in the
future. That is why we are committed to working with our brands in the
coming years to rebuild the country sustainably and efficiently."

ReBuild Ukraine will take place on the grounds of EXPO XXI in Warsaw,
Poland. The Nemetschek Group and its brands will be at a joint stand in Hall
1-A-7, next to the European Commission.

About the Nemetschek Group

The Nemetschek Group is a leading global software provider for digital
transformation in the AEC/O and media industries. Its intelligent software
solutions cover the entire lifecycle of building and infrastructure projects and
enable creatives to optimize their workflows. Customers can design, build,
and manage buildings and infrastructures more efficiently and sustainably
and develop digital content such as visualizations, films, and computer
games more creatively. The software provider is driving innovations such as
digital twins, open standards (OPEN BIM), and sustainability in the AEC/O



industry, constantly expanding its portfolio by investing in deep-tech
startups. More than seven million users worldwide are shaping the world with
the customer-focused solutions of our four divisions. Founded by Prof. Georg
Nemetschek in 1963, the Nemetschek Group today employs around 3,600
experts globally.

Publicly listed since 1999 and quoted on the MDAX and TecDAX, the
company generated revenues of EUR 801.8 million and an EBITDA of EUR
257.0 million in 2022.

About Graphisoft

Graphisoft® empowers teams to design great buildings through award-
winning software solutions, learning programs, and professional services for
the AEC industry. Our award-winning products and solutions support OPEN
BIM for workflow transparency, longevity, and data accessibility for built
assets.  Archicad®, the architects’ BIM software of choice, offers a complete
end-to-end design and documentation workflow for architectural and
integrated architectural and engineering practices of any size. BIMx®, the
most popular mobile and web BIM app, extends the BIM experience to
include all stakeholders in the building design, delivery, and operations
lifecycle. BIMcloud®, the AEC industry’s first and most advanced cloud-based
team collaboration solution, makes real-time collaboration possible across
the globe regardless of the size of the project and the speed or quality of the
team members’ network connection. DDScad solutions support users with
intelligent Mechanical, Electrical, and Plumbing (MEP) design tools,
integrated calculations, and comprehensive documentation of all building
system disciplines. Graphisoft is part of the Nemetschek Group. To learn
more, visit graphisoft.com.
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lifecycle. BIMcloud®, the AEC industry’s first and most advanced cloud-based
team collaboration solution, makes real-time collaboration possible across
the globe regardless of the size of the project and the speed or quality of the
team members’ network connection. DDScad’s intelligent MEP design tools,
integrated calculations, and comprehensive documentation solutions
combine great architecture with peak building performance. Graphisoft is part
of the Nemetschek Group. To learn more, visit www.graphisoft.com
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